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 SHARDUL AGRAWALA_________________________________ 
  

 

Shardul Agrawala is Head of the Environment and Economy Integration Division at 
the OECD Environment Directorate. In this capacity since 2013, Dr. Agrawala leads 
the Directorate’s work on economic-environmental modelling, empirical analysis of 
environmental policies, trade and environment, and on resource productivity and 
waste. He is also Co-Chair of the Research Committee on Inclusiveness for the 
Green Growth Knowledge Platform (GGKP). 

 
At the OECD since 2002, Dr. Agrawala has previously served as Senior Advisor to 
the OECD Secretary General, Co-ordinator of the OECD-wide initiative on New 
Approaches to Economic Challenges, Acting Head of the Climate Change 
Biodiversity and Development Division, and Senior Economist Climate Change. 
 
Dr. Agrawala has published extensively on climate change. He has led teams of 
international experts as Coordinating Lead Author for chapters of the Fourth and 
Fifth Assessment Reports of the Intergovernmental Panel on Climate Change 
(IPCC). He has testified before the US Congress, contributed to the Stern Review, 
and served on advisory panels for the Pilot Program on Climate Resilience of the 
World Bank and the International Climate Initiative (ICI) of the German Government.  
 
Dr Agrawala received his PhD from Princeton University and has previously held 
research positions at Princeton University, Harvard University, Columbia University 
and at the International Institute of Applied Systems Analysis (IIASA). 

  
 AARON COSBEY______________________________________ 
  

 

Aaron Cosbey is a development economist with 25 years of experience in trade, 
investment and sustainable development. His work cuts across a number of IISD 
program areas, with emphasis on trade and investment law and policy, climate 
change and energy. 
 
He served on International Trade Canada's Market Access Advisory Group, the 
Deputy Minister for International Trade's Academic Advisory Council on Canadian 
Trade Policy, and of the Canadian Minister for International Trade's Environmental 
Sectoral Advisory Group on International Trade. He was a member of the UN 
Tripartite Panel of Experts to the Second Preparatory Committee Meeting for Rio 
+20, the CEC’s Expert Panel on Environmental Impacts of NAFTA, the Advisory 
Board of the International Journal of Sustainable Development Law and Policy, the 
Review Board of the Sustainable Development Policy Institute, Islamabad, and the 
Expert Group on Clean Energy and the Multilateral Trading System of ICTSD’s E15 
initiative. He has acted as a consultant to a wide variety of governments and 
institutions, including the Canadian Department of Foreign Affairs and International 
Trade, CIDA, Commonwealth Secretariat, Environment Canada, European 
University Institute, Inter-American Development Bank, Canada’s National Round 
Table on Environment and Economy, NACEC, OECD, UNCTAD, UNDP, UNEP, 
UNFCCC and the World Bank. 
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 CLAUDIA S. DE WINDT_________________________________ 
  

 

Claudia S. de Windt is a Dominican lawyer and expert in political sciences 
specialised in International Environmental Law. Dr. de Windt is currently Chief of the 
Environmental Law, Policy and Good Governance Section and Senior Legal 
Specialist of the Department of Sustainable Development of the Organization of 
American States (OAS). Her work focuses on the effectiveness of environmental 
law, access rights and on good governance for Sustainable Development, areas in 
which she has authored numerous publications. Dr. de Windt has worked with the 
executive, the judiciary and the legislative branch throughout the Americas and has 
broad experience in development of environmental laws and regulations, in treaties 
and international negotiations and conflict resolution. She has directed multiple 
international cooperation projects in these subject matters. Dr. de Windt received her 
Juris Doctor from the Faculty of Juridical and Political Sciences of the Ibero-
American University (UNIBE) in Santo Domingo, Dominican Republic, where she 
completed her thesis in maritime law. Dr. de Windt holds master of Laws (LLM) in 
International Legal Studies from American University’s Washington College of Law. 

  
  
 KAJA BRUNDTLAND EDRÉN_____________________________ 
  

 

Ms. Kaja Brundtland Edrén is currently Senior Adviser at the Section for Trade 
Policy and International Economic Analysis at the Ministry of Foreign Affairs, 
Norway. She specialises in trade, climate and environmental issues. She has also 
been the lead delegate from Norway to the WTO’s Committee on Trade and 
Environment (CTE) in special session. She serves as lead negotiator for Norway in 
the ongoing Environmental Goods Agreement (EGA) negotiations.   
 
Kaja B. Edrén has an undergraduate degree in economics, public law and 
administration, and holds an Executive Master of Management Degree from BI 
Norwegian Business School. 

  

  

 JOSEPH A. FERRANTE_________________________________ 
  
 Joseph A. Ferrante is Director of the Trade and Economics Program within the 

Office of Global Affairs and Policy, Office of International and Tribal Affairs, U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency (EPA). In that capacity, Mr. Ferrante has been the 
lead negotiator on environmental issues in the Trans-Pacific Partnership (TPP) and 
the Transatlantic Trade and Investment Partnership (TTIP) negotiations. He has 
served on the JWPTE Bureau since January 2009, and as Co-Chair since January 
2012. 
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 PETER GOVINDASAMY_________________________________ 
  

 

Peter Govindasamy works for Singapore’s Ministry of Trade and Industry (MTI). As 
Director of the International Trade Cluster, he oversees WTO Policy and 
Negotiations; and the economic aspects of UN Climate Change Negotiations. Before 
joining MTI, he spent 8 years with the Ministry of Foreign Affairs (MFA). At MFA, he 
worked on Foreign Economic Policy issues, European Union matters and 
international organisations such as the ILO, IAEA, WTO and the UN. Since joining 
MTI in 1998, he has had extensive FTA experience as lead negotiator for Services, 
Investment, Government Procurement and Rules issues in a number of Singapore’s 
FTAs. He has extensive experience on trade and environment issues.  
 
He served two stints in Geneva, from 1995 to 1998 (as First Secretary) and  again 
from 2003 to 2009 (as Counsellor). Between 2005 and 2009, he chaired the WTO-
DDA negotiations on Domestic Regulations in Services, and has circulated a draft 
text. He served as the Vice-Chairman of the Committee on Import Licensing 
Measures in 2005 and 2006. He has further chaired the ASEAN-India FTA 
(Services) negotiations. Peter has also led a number of Investment Guarantee 
Agreement (IGA) negotiations. Among others, he concluded the IGA negotiations 
with Colombia (in 2013) and Iran (2012). 
 

  
 ERNESTO GUEVARA ___________________________________ 

  

 

Ernesto Guevara is the Director of Technical Requirements for Foreign Trade of the 
Viceministry of Foreign Trade, Ministry of Foreign Trade and Tourism (MINCETUR) 
of Peru.  
 
Since October 2002, he has served as Peru´s representative at the WTO Committee 
on Sanitary and Phytosanitary Measures. He was previously Peru´s representative 
in the XXXIII External Program of the Hague International Law Academy (Lima, 
December 2005).     
 
Mr. Guevara has also held the position of Chief Negotiator of the Sanitary and 
Phytosanitary Measures Chapter in the following Free Trade Agreements (FTAs): 
Peru-Chile, Peru-Thailand, Peru-Singapore, Peru-Canada, Peru-China, Peru-Japan, 
Peru-Turkey and the Transpacific Partnership Agreement (TPP). Chief Negotiator of 
the Environment Chapter in the following FTAs: Peru-United States, Peru-Canada, 
Peru-Korea, Peru-Japan and the TPP.  
 
He is a lawyer by trade with expertise in International Trade and Public International 
Law. He also concluded Master of Laws (LL.M.) studies in International Economic 
Law from the Pontificia Universidad Católica del Peru.  
 
Mr. Guevara completed post graduate studies in the XX Trade Policy Course at the 
World Trade Organization (Geneva) in 2002 and in the Advanced Program for 
Governmental Officials “A Trade Agenda for the Americas: Multilateral and Regional 
Approaches” at Georgetown University (Washington D.C.) in 2001. 
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MURALITHARAN PARAMASUA___________________________ 
  

 

Muralitharan Paramasua joined the Malaysian Civil Service in 2005 as a Diplomatic 
and Administrative Officer in the Finance Division of the Ministry of Health. In 2011, 
he was promoted and transferred to Ministry of Natural Resources and Environment 
(NRE) and was placed in International Unit of NRE.  
 
In his current position as Undersecretary of Strategic Planning and International 
Division he is in charge of international affairs related to trade and environment 
issues of the Ministry and the Lead Negotiator for trade and environment issues in 
all Free Trade Agreements (FTAs) for Malaysia.  
 
Mr. Paramasua has negotiated the Malaysia-Australia FTA, the Malaysia-EU 
Partnership Cooperation (MEUPCA) and  the Transpacific Partnership Agreement 
(TPPA). At present he is involved in the Malaysia-EFTA Economic Partnership 
Agreement (MEEPA), the Malaysia-EU FTA (MEUFTA) and several Regional Trade 
Agreements such as the Regional Comprehensive Economic Partnership (RCEP) 
involving 16 countries,  the ASEAN-China FTA, ASEAN-India FTA review and 
ASEAN-Hong Kong FTA. 
 
Mr. Paramasua is a native of Taiping in Perak State, Malaysia. He holds a first 
degree in Biohealth Science and a Master's Degree in Criminal Justice from 
University of Malaya, Malaysia and is currently pursuing Ph.D. in International Trade 
focusing on Environmental Goods and Services at the same university. 

  

 VANGELIS VITALIS_____________________________________ 

  

 

Vangelis Vitalis became New Zealand’s Ambassador to the World Trade 
Organisation in Geneva in September 2015 and was elected to chair the WTO 
agriculture negotiations, including to the Nairobi WTO Ministerial Conference which 
eliminated agricultural export subsidies. 
 
Prior to moving to Geneva, Vangelis was Ambassador to the European Union, 
NATO and Sweden and has also had postings to Australia and Russia. From 2008-
2010 Vangelis was the New Zealand Chief Negotiator who led the conclusion of the 
regional ASEAN-Australia-New Zealand Free Trade Agreement (FTA) and the 
separate free trade agreement with Malaysia. He also worked on the FTA with China 
and the precursor to the Trans-Pacific Partnership Agreement, the Pacific-Four FTA. 
Vangelis is currently the Chief Negotiator for the (currently suspended) FTA 
negotiations with the Customs Union of Armenia, Russia, Belarus and Kazakhstan. 
 
Vangelis has worked outside the Ministry, including as an economist at the 
Organisation for Economic Cooperation and Development (OECD) in Paris and for 
the International Economics Expert Group on Illegal-Unregulated and Unreported 
Fishing. Separately, Vangelis was part of a team of economists who helped develop 
a partial equilibrium model for the Russian agriculture sector. He has also worked 
with the Republics of Uzbekistan and Turkmenistan on similar issues. 
 
In addition to chairing the WTO agriculture negotiations, Vangelis chairs the OECD 
Committee on Trade and the Environment and has chaired the OECD Global Forum 
on Trade and Climate Change. Vangelis helped establish the Friends of Fossil Fuel 
Subsidy reform initiative and is currently the New Zealand Special Envoy for the 
Small Advanced Economies’ Initiative. Vangelis speaks Greek, German and Russian 
and is married with three children. 



5 
 

 SHUNTA YAMAGUCHI__________________________________ 
  

 

Shunta Yamaguchi is a Policy Analyst of the Environment and Economy Integration 
division of the OECD Environment Directorate. He joined the OECD in 2014 and 
works on trade and environment issues as well as waste management and resource 
productivity projects. He also works on environmental accounts at the National 
Accounts Division (Statistics Directorate). Prior to his current assignment, he worked 
with the Japan International Cooperation Agency (JICA) on energy and 
environmental projects across Asia, Middle-East and Africa. More specifically, during 
his 5 year work experience with JICA, he was responsible for policy analysis and 
project design on international harmonisation of energy efficiency labelling and 
testing standards, and to promote mutual recognition agreements for laboratory 
testing under the World Trade Organization Technical Barriers to Trade (WTO-TBT) 
agreement. These projects have been delivered in close cooperation with other 
multilateral programmes including the UNDP and APEC. 

  
 YING ZHANG__________________________________________  
  

 

Ying Zhang is the Associate Programme Officer of the Trade, Policy and Planning 
Unit of the Economics and Trade Branch of UNEP. She has over 10 years 
professional experience in trade policy and economic diplomacy.  
 
She joined UNEP in 2014 and now works on the Environment and Trade Hub, 
focusing on governance at trade and environment nexus at both regional and global 
level; capacity building for developing countries on trade in environmental goods and 
services; green industry and trade policy; as well as greening global value chains. 
She also coordinates trade related work under the UN Partnership for Action on 
Green Economy (PAGE) initiative.  
 
Prior to coming to UNEP, she was the Deputy Division Director in the Ministry of 
Commerce of China (MOFCOM). She worked on a number of high-level economic 
dialogues and trade negotiations, as well as country projects on eco-park, CSR, and 
clean technologies. From 2008 to 2010, she was posted as a diplomat to the 
Chinese Embassy in Denmark, focusing on low-carbon economy and climate 
change cooperation between the two countries.   
 
Ying holds a Master's degree on Environmental Change and Management from 
Oxford University (Chevening Scholarship and Dr. Yungtai Hsu Scholarship) and a 
Certificate of Competition Law from College of Europe. 

  
 KUNO ZURKINDEN_____________________________________ 

  

 

Mr. Kuno Zurkinden is Advisor in the WTO Section of Switzerland’s State Secretariat 
for Economic Affairs (SECO). He is the lead delegate to the WTO’s Committee on 
Trade and Environment (CTE) as well as the lead negotiator to the WTO 
negotiations on trade and environment (CTESS) and the Environmental Goods 
Agreement (EGA). In his former position in the Federal Office for the Environment, 
he contributed to the development of a chapter on sustainable development in the 
EFTA free trade agreements with third countries and its first negotiations. 
Furthermore, he worked in the field of green economy/growth in the framework of 
Rio+20 and the OECD. He has served on the JWPTE Bureau since January 2012. 

 






